Mancock <

the signature county of Ohio

Douglas E. Cade, PE, PS

County Engineer
1900 Lima Avenue
Findlay, Ohio 45840
419-422-7433

Hancock County Road Maintenance Materials and Fuel - Aggregate
Thursday, February 16, 2023

Amount of Bid

uar uarry Run

Bidder Name #2 #304.02 | #411.02 | #617.03 | #703.10 #4 #57 #8 #9 QRunry Q (6)22]
Bluffton Stone Co $11.90 $11.50 $11.50 $11.50 $11.90 $11.90 $13.20 $16.50 $17.80 $10.80 $20.00
Custar Stone $16.50 $12.00 $12.00 $12.00 $11.75 $16.00 $15.50 $18.50 $18.00 No Bid No Bid
Gerken Materials, Inc $15.00 $12.00 $12.00 $12.00 $12.00 $15.00 $15.50 $17.75 $17.50 No Bid No Bid
National Lime & Stone Company -
Findlay Quarry $15.25 $12.00 $14.00 $12.00 $16.50 $16.75 $18.50 $22.00 $17.50 $14.50 No Bid
National Lime & Stone Company -
Carey Quarry No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $35.00
Stoneco, Inc $12.00 $10.75 $10.75 $10.75 No Bid $12.00 $14.00 $17.00 $11.00 No Bid No Bid

The above Detailed Bid Tabulation is a true and accruate transcription of the bids recieved for this project on February 16, 2023.

i

Douglas E. Cade, PE, PS
Hancock County Engineer

February 16, 2023




Hancock County Road Maintenance Materials and Fuel - Asphalt Concrete

Hancock <

the signature county of Ohio

Douglas E. Cade, PE, PS
County Engineer

1900 Lima Avenue

Findlay, Ohio 45840

419-422-7433

Thursday, February 16, 2023

Amount of Bid

Special - UPM High
] 405 Bitminous Cold P &
448 Type - 1 Surface 448 Intermediate 301 Base Asphalt Mix Performance
Bidder Name Permanent Cold Mix
Bluffton Stone Co $77.00 $68.00 $66.00 No Bid $120.00
Gerken Materials $77.00 $68.00 $66.00 No Bid $120.00
Maple Grove Materials $76.00 $66.00 $64.00 $125.00 No Bid
Stoneco, Inc $80.00 $68.00 $65.00 No Bid No Bid
Unique Paving Materials No Bid No Bid No Bid $137.50 $137.50

The above Detailed Bid Tabulation is a true and accruate transcription of the bids recieved for this project on February 16, 2023.

Douglas E. Cade, PE, PS
Hancock County Engineer

A7 A A

February 16, 2023




Hancock <

the signature county of Ohio

Douglas E. Cade, PE, PS

County Engineer
1900 Lima Avenue
Findlay, Ohio 45840
419-422-7433

Hancock County Road Maintenance Materials and Fuel - Fuel
Thursday, February 16, 2023

Amount of Bid

Super Unleaded Gasoline (10% Ethanol) Diesel
; Octane / Base Price State Tax Total Price Octane / Base Price State Tax Total Price
Bidder Name Cetane Rating Cetane Rating
Duncan Oil Company* - $2.4406 $0.4087 $2.8493 - $3.1497 $0.5008 $3.6505
Legacy Farmers Co-op 87 $2.3250 $0.3850 $2.7100 42 $3.3270 $0.4700 $3.7970
Petroleum Traders 87 $2.4001 $0.3850 $2.7851 42 $3.1989 $0.4700 $3.6689

*Incomplete bid.

The above Detailed Bid Tabulation is a true and accruate transcription of the bids recieved for this project on February 16, 2023.

Douglas E. Cade, PE, PS
Hancock County Engineer

February 16, 2023




// Douglas E. Cade, PE, PS
County Engineer
1900 Lima Avenue

— thes signature Coun’ry of Ohio Findlay, Ohio 45840
419-422-7433

Hancock County Road Maintenance Materials and Fuel - Liquid Bituminous Material
Thursday, February 16, 2023

Amount of Bid

Bidder Name RS 2 Emulsion Prime

Asphalt Materials, Inc. $2.40 $2.10

The above Detailed Bid Tabulation is a true and accruate transcription of the bids recieved for this project on February 16 2023

February 16, 2023

Douglas E. Cade, PE, PS
Hancock County Engineer




